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A SPIRIT ‘CLASS-REUNION’

QUANTUM  HEALING

(Prior to the channeling, Sohrab shared with the group details of a recent personal 
session he had given a client, in which she was taught Quantum Healing.  He 
described the technique and briefly spoke of its vastness.)

Greetings!

Today is a very, very special energetic day.  It is one in which all those who have 
passed over (no matter when) and all those who will choose to pass over during the 
course of this year, are being offered special blessings and energetic benefits.

Take a moment now and think of those in the spirit realm that you would like to 
bless: family members, ancestors, friends, even famous people whom you respect.  
Energetically embrace and bless them; send them joy and light. Also do the same 
for those on Earth whom you think might choose to pass over this year. (Long 
pause)

Now please bless those parts of the self that are dying: old beliefs and 
thought-patterns, outmoded structures and the energetic debris that you are 
currently releasing.  (Pause)

Please open up and sense the multitude of visitors who are in this room today: 
Master energies, loved ones and friends alike.  Acknowledge them and bless them. 
(Pause)

Now receive their blessings.  (Long pause)



And so it is, and so it is, and so it is.

Thank these friends home with you today.  They will be with you all through the 
upcoming night.  No fear when you sense them!  They are simply loved ones who 
will be with you.  Please do not do the self a disservice by closing up your energies 
in fear or resistance.

Why today?  A quantum energetic circuit has been created from the very core 
center of planet Earth.   This interlinks every soul that has incarnated on Earth with 
those who are currently on Earth.   Imagine it to be a huge class reunion, joyously 
attended by all ex- and current Earth students.

Even these ‘ex-students’ of a hundred years ago or more are thoroughly enjoying 
re-visiting Planet Earth, interacting with you (their descendants) and having a 
party.

This energetic invitation has been extended by Mother Gaia, and spans a single 
24-hour period.   Many are here to observe how things have changed: most find it 
fascinating.  And those who are going to ‘graduate’ soon are requesting the visitors 
to be ready to help them acclimatize to the spirit realm, when they pass over. 

These visitors also include all the Masters who had incarnated, at some point, on 
Planet Earth.  Many of them have not come in their Master avatars, but instead in 
their past human forms.  Yes; some have deliberately reduced their Master 
vibrations to re-experience ‘being human again’…just for a day.

Dear Friends, very few on Earth are going to be conscious of this.  You are among 
the lucky few.  Enjoy it!  Feel free to share this information with anyone you want.

BLESSINGS.  THE ENERGIES OF STARLIGHT BLESS YOU.

Starlight is an Angel; one of the many keepers of Planet Earth.

(Sohrab shifts energies)



GREETINGS!

Yes; you are all here today because each of you is, inherently, a Quantum healer.  
It is now also vital for you to absorb and enjoy these energies for the self, without 
any particular intent.  Why?  Because when you are a beacon of Quantum 
frequencies, no matter where you go or what you do, you are blessing others with 
these energies.

As you drive home today after this meeting, even if you are laughing and joking 
with friends in the car, you energies will be blessing every single person and 
apartment building that you pass on the way.  If you pass a hospital or a slum, you 
will energetically bless every patient and resident.   If you even briefly think of a 
friend, or ponder over a situation taking place across the world, you are sending 
these quantum energies there…all at a higher-conscious level. 

We remind you to go beyond your limited perspective of the word ‘healing’.  
Quantum energies help individuals connect seamlessly with every aspect of 
themselves in alternate lifetimes and dimensions.   All these aspects then achieve 
a new level of balance and equilibrium.   And balance brings about good health 
and harmony in all the incarnated and dimensional aspects.

This is based on 12-dimensional sacred geometry.  You have heard of this 
concept, but you have never before had the necessary frequency to work with it.  
You now do. 

Quantum Healing is so freeing.  It may be joyously directed to a single person, a 
world situation, a country or to Planet Earth herself.  The ‘effort’ required by you 
while directing it outward is the same, whether you are working for one person or 
one million people.  It simply needs a though; an intent. 

Now bring it into every aspect of your lives.   Learn to open to quantum energies 
when you are going about your daily tasks: working at home or in the office, 
reading a book, watching a film, socializing with friends and so on.   Put it into 
your food, your clothing and your jewelry.  Embrace your home, your family, staff, 
and your friends with it.   Make it a part of everyday life.   This should not be 
viewed as a ‘practice’; it should become a new form of existence. 



Quantum Healing cannot be easily explained in words.  It has to be experienced, 
internalized and understood from within.

Any questions?

May we use this for our Universal friends as well?

Of course!  You may use it to the ends of the Universe. 

Can this energy be misused?

A good question.  This energy cannot be misused, as it is based on 12-dimensional 
sacred geometry, which goes far beyond the concept of ‘negativity’. It is 
comprised of dark matter; the very fabric of the Universe.  When you start working 
with this, you will discover that your concepts of ‘positive’ and ‘negative’ vanish.

Can we use it to help us overcome our fears?

Of course!  Use it in any way you desire: to cleanse, bless, grow, evolve, heal, 
expand and so on. 

(R.) Where does gratitude come into all of this?

As usual, the group Oracle speaks! (Laughter)  You may recall that we have told 
you that gratitude is core center of your earthly cells.  The very first vibration that 
you experience, when you are but a dot in your mother’s womb, is gratitude to the 
Universe (and to the self) for having given you the opportunity to grow and evolve 
through your upcoming incarnation. 

What of love?

Love is an energy that flows through all the various layers of your cells; gratitude 
is the core center of it.   Without gratitude, you cannot work with Quantum 
Healing.

THE COSMIC MEHER BLESSES YOU.

Yes, he is a grand master of science, mathematics and sacred geometry.  Also 
humour!

                                             **************************




