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EARTH’S NEW ENERGETIC GRID

THE EFFECT OF THE NEW ENERGIES OF 2017 ON THE BODY (PART 1)

…THE BRAIN, PITUITARY AND PINEAL GLANDS

…THE THIRD EYE

…THE THROAT CHAKRA

Greetings!

If you recollect your high school geography, you will remember that earth is 
surrounded by layers you have called the troposphere, stratosphere, 
ionosphere and exosphere.

If you tune into the exosphere, you will sense a hub of activity taking place 
there.  This is a new energetic grid that is currently being set up around 
planet Earth by a group of  Universal Masters, guides and celestial 
‘architects’. 

This new grid, which is still under construction, is a magnificent new 
energetic structure; one which will be fully activated at the exact point when 
2016 gives way to 2017.   If you choose to tune into this process at that 
moment, you will experience a tremendous surge of energy in your physical 
structure.  

It really doesn’t matter whether or not your watch coincides with the actual 
time or not: your intent will be enough to make sure this happens ‘at the 
right moment’.  It also doesn’t really matter whether or not you remember to 



tune in; these energies will still find their way into your physical and 
energetic structures. 

This marvelous new grid will now offer the inhabitant of earth a level of 
consciousness they have never before experienced.   But there is a ‘catch’.  
The degree to which you can access this grid will depend entirely on your 
personal level of evolution, the degree to which you have worked on the self 
in the past, and the amount of cleansing you have done. 

However, no one will ‘lose out’.  Once active, the emanations from this grid 
will be so powerful that even those who have not worked on themselves will 
find inner urgings to do so.  Then they, too, will slowly grow, learn, evolve 
and eventually access the magnificence of this grid. 

These energies are going to do several things for you.  At first, they will 
offer you an accelerated level of knowledge, wisdom and awareness.  This 
is because the very first area these new energies will target will be the 
brain, pituitary and pineal glands. 

Let us hypothetically assume that on December 31st, you are worried and 
confused about a certain personal issue or relationship.  If you open to 
these new frequencies at the stroke of midnight and then examine the very 
same issue on January 1st, you will find a difference in the way you perceive 
it, and you will be able to then work with it and through it more efficiently. 

So, should you choose to consciously open to these energies on the stroke 
of midnight, make sure that you are physically secure, as you may 
experience a wave of dizziness or disorientation.

The effect of these energies on this area will offer you a tremendous surge 
in brain activity during the initial part of the year.   But again, this depends 
on you.  If you choose to remain trapped in a prior issue, and are unwilling 
to let go of the ‘pleasure of past pain’, you will not be able to use these 
energies to view the situation differently.   Simplistically, you are being given 
fuel in the tank; but whether or not you choose to start the car and drive off 
is your choice.



The second area they will hit is the third eye chakra.   Now, you are all so 
accustomed to believing that your third eye resides exclusively in this area 
(pointing to the forehead).  Yes, the predominance of these energies still 
resides here.  But now, your entire physical body is your third eye. 

So the new energies will target the third eye and consciously distribute 
these energies throughout the physical, so that every part becomes 
psychically and physically aware.  Don’t resist this process. 

You may wonder, “Why would I want my liver or kidney to be my third eye?  I 
connect from the center of my forehead!” 

Here are the advantages.  These body parts are now less likely to go out of 
balance, as they will be vibrating with high-frequency, self-aware, 
self-healing energies.  However, if there is a disturbance in that area, due to 
the surfacing of an emotional issue, you will be able to tune in directly to 
this area and instantly know what the issue is, and how to resolve it.   In 
short, it’s going to help you heal the self, and others, at an accelerated rate. 

We remind you: this coming year brings you many magnificent energetic 
gifts, but the most powerful will be the ability to self-heal.   If you dedicate 
yourself, with full certainty and conviction, to the self, you can be the 
healthiest you have ever been in your life.  You can wipe out disease. You 
can bring your organs into balance.  You can bring your own meridians in to 
full flow and balance.  You can speedily heal broken bones.   You can do 
virtually anything with your physical health and body, provided you tune into 
the new energies, and are certain that you can do so.  

So now if there is discomfort in any body part, you can command the third 
eye that resides there to heal itself.   You don’t have to work from the 
forehead and transmit energies elsewhere.   Instead, you work directly from 
the core of the organ.

Similarly, as your entire body is now your third eye, when offering healing to 
another, all parts of you are equally potent and powerful.   Your palms, for 
example, carry third eye consciousness, so there is no need to ‘activate’ 



them anymore.  Similarly, your thoughts, words and intent carry third eye 
consciousness.

When you walk on the road, and since the soles of your feet are your third 
eye, every step you take blesses and energizes Mother Earth.   You don’t 
even have make an intent: it’s just going to happen unconsciously.  Every 
person you touch with love will be activated.  Every mouthful you ingest is 
blessing your body: your hands energize the cutlery, which then energize 
the food itself.  Wherever you go, your entire body will emanate energies 
which bless and heal those around you.   Such is the power of the extended 
third eye.

When you enter a space of lower frequency, you will be urging the space 
itself to raise its vibrations.  Similarly, you will be blessing your homes and 
offices at all times, by simply being present there.   When you interact with 
friends or enemies, you will be energizing them, urging them into balance 
and alignment.  And all of this will happen unconsciously. 

Now understand what it means to be divinity itself.  You are God. 

However, this activation of the full-body third eye brings with it great 
energetic responsibility.   If you allow yourself to direct anger, hatred, or 
envy towards another person, you will multiply that frequency and do them 
real harm.  

We don’t expect you to live like saints.  But we do expect you to be alert.  If 
you find repeated anger or hatred or jealously arising about a certain 
person or situation, we do ask you to consciously choose to change the 
frequency.   Even if you cannot find it in yourself to direct love or peace 
towards that person, at least disengage from them. 

Remember, energies move in circles.  When you put out that anger and 
hatred, it only loops back to you.   And when you put out love and blessings, 
you get that back ten-fold.

Just examine your reactions to current situations like demonetization, or 
the election of the new president.   The more you sit and stew in anger, 



hatred and frustration, the more it is going to loop back and multiply those 
aspects in the self.

If you are unhappy about a certain decision or situation, find a way to 
energize it so that it works in the smoothest and most efficient manner 
possible. 

We continue to give you leeway in this area till the end of this month, but 
starting January, this responsibility is yours.

Supposing you have to stand up in court and accuse somebody, then what 
happens?

We are not urging you to sit back and give in to everything.  If you feel the 
need to stand up and defend yourself and your rights, you MUST.  Even 
more that you did in the past.   But you must find a way to access these 
new energies and fill yourself to such a degree that you are vibrating at a 
very high level when you face the situation.  And blaze the entire situation 
with the power of justice. 

Similarly, if you feel the need to stand up publically and challenge a certain 
law or a governmental policy, please do so.   That is productive.  But sitting 
around with your friends and grumbling endlessly will not change the 
situation, it will only further the energy of frustration and helplessness in 
you. 

Currently, the entire human race is being taught to take individual and 
collective responsibility for all that happens, rather than pointing fingers at 
others and conveniently apportioning blame to them. 

I want to know about the new energies and different time zones.  Will they 
enter earth at exactly the same ‘time’, or will they correspond to 12 midnight 
in each a time zone?



A very good question!

Yes, and it comes from a Geography teacher! (Laughter)

In this case, the energies are going to be released in accordance with 
time-zones.  So people worldwide will be activated at different times.   This 
has no bearing on your nationality.  It will depend on where you are 
physically on December 31st.

(Smiling) Visualize the illumination of the Earth: light after light after light, 
slowly encircling the entire planet.

How are we going to be meditative enough to receive these energies at the 
stroke of midnight, with all the noise and crackers going off? (Laughter)

Are you, a Lightworker, so weak that you cannot go beyond the noise and 
access these energies? (Laughter)  We, in fact, suggest that you use the 
cacophony to expand your structure, so that you open even wider to these 
frequencies.  Make what you perceive as your disadvantage, your 
advantage!

Could these new energies be Source-Consciousness?

Yes, they are.

Many of us consume a lot of alcohol on the 31st.  Will this affect our 
connection with these new energies? (Laughter)

Consume as much alcohol as you want.   Bless it, and say to the self, “This 
is the nectar of the Gods!  I am imbibing pure consciousness!”  Make it fuel 
for your all-body third eye. (Laughter)

I am a flight attendant.  I will be flying from Japan to Abu Dhabi on the 31st 
night.  So how many times will I be activated?? (Laughter)

When it happens to be 12 midnight the very first time, by your watch, you 
will be activated!

Friends, the same activation will also take place for those who are 



unconscious, in a coma or mentally non-functional.  But by choosing to 
consciously merge with the new energies, you will not only speed up the 
process, but also make it more exciting and intense for the self.

How would this affect the terrorist? A murderer? Or others like that?

An excellent question! Thank you.

These energies will do exactly the same for all people who are going to 
create ‘waves’, be it a terrorist or a head of state who may be about to 
introduce a new policy.  However, the energies will urge the individual to 
assess whether or not he is in keeping with his soul mission.  

If his soul mission is to perpetrate an act of terror, then he will be able to do 
so in a seamless manner.  But if his mission is not to do it, then the 
energies will urge him to awaken and ‘not do it’. 

I wonder if I have been unconsciously resisting these new energies.  I can 
already feel their power, but I find a lot of awful stuff has been coming up for 
me recently.

We had warned all of you that, during the current period, a lot of debris 
would be arising: crying fits, depression, loneliness, anger, irritability, and so 
on.  It’s all part of the last phase of the cleanse.  Let it surface.  Don’t block 
or deny it. 

What if a lot of emotional abuse is being directed at you?

First acknowledge how it makes you feel.   Find out what it is bringing up in 
you.  Once again, make your disadvantage your advantage.  Allow it to help 
you acknowledge aspects of the self that you wouldn’t otherwise have 
examined.   And then discover how you can touch your power and act in the 
given situation.

Now that everything is fluid, even a terrorist whose mission might have been 
to perpetrate terror, can surely chose to shift course of his own free will?



This new grid is erasing Earth’s karmic trend and patterns, and allowing all 
her inhabitants a blank canvas on which to paint their future.  Nothing… not 
even that which you had pre-planned before you incarnated…is necessarily 
going to hold good any longer, unless you choose to continue the same 
life-plan. 

These are the ‘twists and turns’ you are likely to encounter this year.  There 
will be numerous unexpected events created this year, due to sudden 
changes in the courses of lives around you.  And in the same way, you will 
make astounding changes in your own lives, which will then affect others.  
Now very little can be predicted or foretold, even by us.   It will all depend on 
you. 

How is Mother Earth going to use these energies? 

She is welcoming these new energies.   This shift, from 2016 to 2017, is the 
largest energetic shift anyone in this lifetime will have ever experienced.  
Mother Gaia is welcoming in these new energies as she truly desires to 
recreate the self: with joy, enthusiasm and vigor.   

Tremendous changes are going to take place in her structure: earth shifts 
and movements, changes in the pH balance of her soil, changes in the 
content of all her liquids from water to oil, and so on.  Wind patterns and 
tides are going to change.  Weather is going to change even more rapidly 
than it already has.  Certain farmlands are going to turn barren, whereas 
other areas will suddenly turn fertile. 

You will have to keep pace with her.  But in general she is going to radiate 
such joy that you will be able to feel it, and connect with her even more 
strongly. 

How can a volcanic eruption possibly be beneficial?

Don’t you sometimes feel much better after you have verbally erupted and 
expressed your truth? (Laughter)  Doesn’t Mother Gaia have that permission 
as well?



We have spoken of the crown and third eye; now let us speak of the throat 
chakra.  As you will have noticed, the energies are going to affect you 
sequentially, chakra by chakra. 

The throat chakra will be gradually opened up over the course of the first 
few months of the year 2017.   You will find, on a personal level, the urgent 
need to speak up and speak out.  To speak your truth. To say things as they 
are.  To stop mincing words.   To stop hiding behind verbal facades.

This will happen over time, and you will start to enjoy the power of your own 
conviction.   A beautiful shift: welcome it.

How you exercise this newfound openness is your choice.  We certainly 
don’t urge you to be harsh, acerbic or rude.  But speak the truth, and speak 
up and speak out.

We will continue this discourse next week.

YOU ARE EMBRACED BY TWO ENERGIES TODAY; THOSE OF THE MAHA 
AVATAAR BAAJI AND THE HIGH LORD MITREYA.  

BLESSINGS!

                                     *****************************


